
                Turramurra Public School  

Mrs McIntyre, Ms McGuire, Mrs Varma, Mrs Young & Mrs Van Roon 

Year 2, Learning at Home – Week 11 

 Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday 

Task Have you watered your 
plants/garden? 

Look after your pet day! 
Walk them, wash them, 
feed them, teach them a 
new trick.  

Show an act of kindness 
for a member of your 
family today. 

Use the disinfectant to 
clean all the door 
handles and knobs 
around the house. Don’t 
forget the fridge! 

Enjoy your long weekend 
 

Morning 
Reading Activity 

Gary by Leila Rudge - 
https://www.youtube.co
m/watch?v=ipCluF4pX4
4 (Storytime with 
Susan) 

Discussion Points 

How do you think Gary 

feels when he gets left 

behind? 

Examine the page 

where the racing 

pigeons are discussing 

their adventures. Leila 

Rudge has used 

symbols to show what 

they are saying, rather 

than words. Discuss or 

write down what you 

think they are saying, 

English 
Choose a non-fiction 
book to read aloud with 
a parent/carer. Before 
reading, what do you 
already know about the 
topic? 
● What was this book 

about?  

● What are three facts 

you have learnt from 

reading it? 

Writing 
Write a literary recount 
of the book ‘Gary’.  
 
Make sure you: 
- use your own words; 

don’t copy the book 
- focus on the 

important events and 
write them in order. 

 
 
 

English 
Read Edward The Emu 
by Sheena Knowles and 
Rod Clement -  
https://www.youtube.co
m/watch?v=0P74MJ3C
MuU (Good Night Sleep 
Tight) 
● Pause the video and 

read it aloud.  

Discussion Points 

● Does it have a good 

beginning and 

ending?  

● Are the characters 

interesting?  What 

makes them 

interesting? 

● Which illustration in 

the story was your 

favourite?  

 
 
 

English 
Choose a non-fiction 
book to read aloud with 
a parent/carer. Read the 
book aloud.  
 
Create an informative 
poster using the 
information you have 
learned from the book.  
 
Literacy Planet 
2 tasks only 
 
Handwriting 
Choose a letter of your 
liking and complete the 
pages related to that 
letter. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Good Friday 
 

Happy Holidays!! 
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explaining why you 

think that. 

Look at the final page 

where all of the pigeons 

are riding the bus with 

Gary. What might some 

of the people be 

thinking or feeling? Use 

their facial expressions 

as a guide. 

What does the reader 

know about Gary from 

reading the book? List 

some describing words 

about him. 

Extension: Research 
pigeons online. Where 
do they live? What do 
they eat? Create an 
informative poster 
about pigeons by 
drawing a picture of a 
pigeon in the middle of 
the poster and 
surrounding it with 
interesting facts.  
 
 
 
 

Literacy Planet 
2 tasks only 
 
Handwriting 
Choose a letter of your 
liking and complete the 
pages related to that 
letter. 
 
 

Writing  
Using the template 
provided, write a book 
review for Edward the 
Emu.  
 
Literacy Planet 
2 tasks only 
 
Handwriting 
Choose a letter of your 
liking and complete the 
pages related to that 
letter. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Good Friday 
 

Happy Holidays!!  
 

Break  
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Middle Mathematics 
Problem Solving: 
The answer to a 
problem was 12. 
Write down all the 
possible questions that 
may have been asked 
into your workbook. 
 
Mathletics 
2 tasks only 
 
Personal Health 
Complete 2 pages of 
the Wellbeing book. 

Mathematics 
Problem Solving:  
You’re driving past a 
farmyard and see 10 
legs. Draw the animals 
you might be looking at 
in your workbook.  
Tip: Remember you 
have only seen 10 legs. 
 
Mathletics 
2 tasks only 

Mathematics 
Find a deck of cards 
around your home and 
write number sentences. 
Remove the picture 
cards before you start. 
For example:  
Addition- draw two cards 
and add them together. 
If I picked up a 5 and a 6 
my number sentence will 
look like this: 
5 + 6= 11 
 
Complete 10 addition 
number sentences.  
Complete 10 subtraction 
number sentences.  
Challenge option-try this 
for 10 multiplication 
sentences 
(draw arrays to help you 
if you get a tricky one).  
 
Mathletics 
2 tasks only 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Mathematics 
Problem Solving  
 

 
 
How many squares can 
you make using the 
above dot grid? 
Consider 1x1, 2x2, 3x3 
and 4x4 squares.  
Draw the grid in your 
workbook. Try to show 
all combinations in a 
different colour.  
 
Mathletics 
2 tasks only 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Good Friday 
 

Happy Holidays!! 

Break  
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Afternoon Creative Arts 
Make Easter Bunny 
ears with what you can 
find at home (paper, 
fabric, leaves) 
 
AND/OR 
 
Leila Rudge has used 
collage to create 
beautifully varied 
illustrations. Create an 
artwork using collage in 
a similar style to Gary. 
You could use 
interesting paper from 
magazines, scraps or 
wrapping paper, 
recycled material or 
patterns you have 
made. 
 
Take a photo of your 
work and upload it on 
SeeSaw.  
 

French  
See French Tab on 
School Website under 
‘Learning From Home’ 
 
PE 
Cosmic Yoga 
Find a cosmic yoga clip 
on youtube that you like 
and follow along. 
 

Creative Arts  
Using the link below, 
print and create an 
Easter Egg basket. 
 
Challenge 
Draw up your own 
Easter Egg basket so it 
is larger than your 
template version.  
 
https://www.kidspot.com
.au/things-to-
do/seasonal/easter/east
er-egg-basket/news-
story/052bfbd71e763dce
60c966d0da7252bb 
 
 

Creative Arts 
Look for some small 
rocks and leaves around 
the garden or your 
apartment. 
Paint them in an Easter 
theme. 
 
PE  
Fun Indoor Activity  
https://www.youtube.co
m/watch?v=LbE-
fsXTYno 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Good Friday 
 

Happy Holidays!! 
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